

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

- _13. Award bid(s) for the purchase of the following for county precincts:**
- a. Road paving;**
 - b. AC-5 asphalt, AC-10 asphalt, CRS-2 emulsion, MC-30 road oil, and seal coat sealers or proven equal;**
 - c. Road materials;**
 - d. Herbicides; and**
 - e. Culverts.**

Motion by Commissioner Gertson to approve awarding the bids for the purchase of the following for county precincts Road Pavings; AC-5 asphalt, AC-10 asphalt, CRS-2 emulsion, MC-30 road oil, and seal coat sealers or proven equal; Road materials; Herbicides; Based on price, availability, quality and location; seconded by Commissioner Neuendorff; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried, it was so ordered. Discussion followed.

Motion by Commissioner Neuendorff to deny the Culverts bid; Raymie Kana, County Auditor advised that we can reject the bid and have a rebid; seconded by Commissioner Kubesch; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried, it was so ordered.

(See Attachment)

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

**ROAD PAVING – BID OPENING: MARCH 9, 2022 – 2:00 P. M.
FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2022 TO MARCH 31, 2023**

Contractor: Matagorda Constr & Materials				
Double Asphaltting	One Rock Island	Two Weimar	Three Frelsburg	Four Eagle Lake
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply MC-30 prime oil per gal.	\$3.60	\$3.60	\$3.60	\$3.60
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-5 per gal.	\$3.85	\$3.85	\$3.85	\$3.85
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-10 per gal.	\$3.85	\$3.85	\$3.85	\$3.85
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply CRS-2 per gal.	\$3.65	\$3.65	\$3.65	\$3.65
Cont. spread rock per cu. yd.	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$5.00

Seal Coating	One	Two	Three	Four
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-5 asphalt per gal.	\$3.85	\$3.85	\$3.85	\$3.85
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-10	\$3.85	\$3.85	\$3.85	\$3.85
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply CRS-2 asphalt per gal.	\$3.65	\$3.65	\$3.65	\$3.65
Cont. spread rock per cu. yd.	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$5.00

Contractor: H & C Construction Co				
Double Asphaltting	One Rock Island	Two Weimar	Three Frelsburg	Four Eagle Lake
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply MC-30 prime oil per gal.	\$5.70	\$5.70	\$5.70	\$5.70
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-5 per gal.	\$4.62	\$4.62	\$4.62	\$4.62
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-10 per gal.	\$4.62	\$4.62	\$4.62	\$4.62
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply CRS-2 per gal.	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Cont. spread rock per cu. yd.	\$0.01	\$0.01	\$0.01	\$0.01

Seal Coating	One	Two	Three	Four
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-5 asphalt per gal.	\$4.62	\$4.62	\$4.62	\$4.62
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-10	\$4.62	\$4.62	\$4.62	\$4.62
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply CRS-2 asphalt per gal.	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Cont. spread rock per cu. yd.	\$0.01	\$0.01	\$0.01	\$0.01

Contractor:				
Double Asphaltting	One Rock Island	Two Weimar	Three Frelsburg	Four Eagle Lake
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply MC-30 prime oil per gal.				
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-5 per gal.				
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-10 per gal.				
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply CRS-2 per gal.				
Cont. spread rock per cu. yd.				

Seal Coating	One	Two	Three	Four
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-5 asphalt per gal.				
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply AC-10				
Cont. fur. Heat, haul & apply CRS-2 asphalt per gal.				
Cont. spread rock per cu. yd.				