

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING  
MARCH 14, 2022**

- \_14. Award bid(s) for fuel for County Precincts, Sheriff's Department, EMS and Robert R. Wells Jr. Airport.

**Motion by Commissioner Wessels to accept both bids for fuel for County Precincts, Sheriff's Department, EMS and Robert R. Wells Jr. Airport, based on price and availability; seconded by Commissioner Neuendorff; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried, it was so ordered.**

**(See Attachment)**

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING  
MARCH 14, 2022**

**COLORADO COUNTY FUEL BIDS  
OPENED PUBLICLY MARCH 9, 2022 AT 2:00 P.M.  
FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2022 TO MARCH 31, 2023**

Precinct No. One (1)	Octane Rating	Colorado County Oil	Tri-County Petroleum	Jaguar Fueling Svcs			
Diesel	HSD	\$0.30	\$0.3025	\$0.75			
Diesel	LSD	\$0.30	\$0.3025	\$0.75			
Gasoline	87	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			
Gasoline	89	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			
Gasoline	91	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			

Precinct No. Two (2)	Octane Rating						
Diesel	HSD	\$0.30	\$0.3025	\$0.75			
Diesel	LSD	\$0.30	\$0.3025	\$0.75			
Gasoline	87	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			
Gasoline	89	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			
Gasoline	91	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			

Precinct No. Three (3)	Octane Rating						
Diesel	HSD	\$0.30	\$0.3025	\$0.75			
Diesel	LSD	\$0.30	\$0.3025	\$0.75			
Gasoline	87	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			
Gasoline	89	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			
Gasoline	91	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			

Precinct No. Four (4)	Octane Rating						
Diesel	HSD	\$0.30	\$0.3025	\$0.75			
Diesel	LSD	\$0.30	\$0.3025	\$0.75			
Gasoline	87	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			
Gasoline	89	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			
Gasoline	91	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			

Sheriff Gasoline	Octane Rating						
Gasoline	87	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			
Gasoline	89	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			
Gasoline	91	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			

CCSF EMS	Octane Rating						
Diesel	LSD	\$0.30	\$0.2925	\$0.75			

Robert R. Wells Jr.							
100 LL avgas		No Bid	\$0.3625	No Bid			
Jet A		No Bid	\$0.3325	No Bid			