

10/11/2022	1 1/2"-1 3/4"	1 1/2"-1 3/4"	1 1/2"-1 3/4"	3/4"	3/4"	3/4"	1 1/2" Crushed Concrete Stone Free PU	CRUSHED ASPHALT DEL	CRUSHED ASPHALT PU	1 1/2"-1 3/4" Crushed White Rock DELV	1 1/2"-1 3/4" Crushed White Rock PU	1 1/2"-1 3/4" Crushed White Rock Hauling	Crusher Run 2 1/4" BASE DEL	Crusher Run 2 1/4" Base PU	Crusher Run 2 1/4" Base Hauling	FlexBase 1 1/2" - PU	Base 3/4" PU	Red Rock Iron Ore 2" DEL	Red Rock Iron Ore 2" PU	#4 Washed Rock Chips 3/8" DEL	#4 Washed Rock Chips 3/8" PU	Oversize Rock 4x8 DEL	Oversize Rock 4x8 PU	Type D Rock 3/8 & 1/2 DEL	Type D Rock 3/8 & 1/2 PU	
Richard Drake																										
Powderly, TX																										
Precinct 1	41.15		26.25	37.10		26.25																				
Precinct 2	38.49		26.50	37.35		26.50																				
Precinct 3	36.55		23.65	34.50		23.65																				
Precinct 4 Ridgeway	36.60		23.90	34.75		23.90																				
Precinct 4 Birthright	33.40		20.50	31.35		20.50																				
County Wide		No Bid	0.27		No Bid	0.27																				
Martin Marietta																										
Powderly, TX																										
Precinct 1		14.00								14.00			14.00								62.00					23.50
Precinct 2		14.00								14.00			14.00								62.00					23.50
Precinct 3		14.00								14.00			14.00								62.00					23.50
Precinct 4 Ridgeway		14.00								14.00			14.00								62.00					23.50
Precinct 4 Birthright		14.00								14.00			14.00								62.00					23.50
County Wide Pct		14.00								14.00			14.00								62.00					23.50
Sells Recycling																										
Precinct 1																										
Precinct 2																										
Precinct 3																										
Precinct 4 Ridgeway																										
Precinct 4 Birthright																										
County Wide Pct																										
SEATON Construction																										
Pit: Avinger																										
Precinct 1																			38.00							
Precinct 2																			39.25							
Precinct 3																			35.50							
Precinct 4 Ridgeway																			38.00							
Precinct 4 Birthright																										
County Wide Pct																										
R K Hall																										
Sawyer Dk																										
Precinct 1	27.29			26.25																	47.75				33.75	
Precinct 2	26.20			25.25																	46.75				33.00	
Precinct 3	25.35			24.40																	45.90				31.90	
Precinct 4 Ridgeway	25.70			24.75																	46.25				32.50	
Precinct 4 Birthright	25.70			24.75																	46.25				32.50	
County Wide Pct		9.45			8.50																	30.00				18.00
Commerce Sand & Gravel																										
Pit:																										
Precinct 1																										
Precinct 2																										
Precinct 3																										
Precinct 4																										
County Wide Pct								20.00																		
Wood County Asphalt																										
Mintola, TX																										
Precinct 1																										
Precinct 2																										
Precinct 3																										
Precinct 4 Ridgeway																										
Precinct 4 Birthright																										
County Wide Pct																										
Sustainable Pavement Tech																										
Pit: Dallas																										
Precinct 1								50.00	20.00																	
Precinct 2								50.00	20.00																	
Precinct 3								50.00	20.00																	
Precinct 4 Ridgeway								50.00	20.00																	
Precinct 4 Birthright								50.00	20.00																	

10/11/2022	Seal Coat Rock OC3 DEL	Seal Coat Rock or 3 PU			15x18 RIP PU	15x24 RIP PU	Rip 12" DEL	Rip 12" PU	#57 PU	Shingles 1/2" minus tearoffs DEL	Shingles 1/2" minus tear offs PU
Richard Drake											
Powderly, TX											
Precinct 1											
Precinct 2											
Precinct 3											
Precinct 4 Ridgeway											
Precinct 4 Birthright											
County Wide											
Martin Marietta											
Powderly, TX											
Precinct 1		92.00		92.00	39.00	39.00				21.50	
Precinct 2		92.00		92.00	39.00	39.00				21.50	
Precinct 3		92.00		92.00	39.00	39.00				21.50	
Precinct 4 Ridgeway		92.00		92.00	39.00	39.00				21.50	
Precinct 4 Birthright		92.00		92.00	39.00	39.00				21.50	
County Wide Pct		92.00		92.00	39.00	39.00				21.50	
Setis Recycling											
Precinct 1											
Precinct 2											
Precinct 3											
Precinct 4 Ridgeway											
Precinct 4 Birthright											
County Wide Pct											20.00 Yd
SEATON Construction											
Pit: Avinger											
Precinct 1											
Precinct 2											
Precinct 3											
Precinct 4 Ridgeway											
Precinct 4 Birthright											
County Wide Pct											
R K Hall											
Sawyer Ok											
Precinct 1	47.75			47.75				50.00			
Precinct 2	46.75			46.75							
Precinct 3	45.90			45.90				51.25			
Precinct 4 Ridgeway	46.25			46.25							
Precinct 4 Birthright	46.25			46.25							
County Wide Pct		30.00			30.00				30.00		
Commerce Sand & Gravel											
Pit:											
Precinct 1											
Precinct 2											
Precinct 3											
Precinct 4											
County Wide Pct											
Wood County Asphalt											
Mineloa, TX											
Precinct 1											
Precinct 2											
Precinct 3											
Precinct 4 Ridgeway											
Precinct 4 Birthright											
County Wide Pct											
Sustainable Pavement Tech											
Pit: Dallas											
Precinct 1										55.00	25.00
Precinct 2										55.00	25.00
Precinct 3										55.00	25.00
Precinct 4 Ridgeway										55.00	25.00
Precinct 4 Birthright										55.00	25.00

10/10/2022	Oil Sand Ready Mix DEL	Oil Sand Ready Mix PU	Oil Sand Ready Mix Hauling	Asphalt Hot Mix Type D DELV	Asphalt Hot Mix Type D PU	Asphalt Hot Mix Type D Hauling	Type B Hot or Cold DEL	Type B Hot or Cold PU	TYPE B Hot or Cold Hauling	Hot Mix Cold Laid Type D DEL	Hot Mix Cold Laid Type D PU	Hot Mix Cold Laid Type D Hauling
ROAD MATERIALS												
Richard Drake Const Powderly, Tx												
Precinct 1	95.55		13.75	102.45		13.75				98.55		13.75
Precinct 2	95.80		14.00	102.70		14.00				98.80		14.00
Precinct 3	93.00		11.20	99.90		11.20				96.00		11.20
Precinct 4 Ridgeway	94.00		12.20	100.90		12.20				97.00		12.20
Precinct 4 Birthright	91.40		9.60	98.30		9.60				94.20		9.60
County Wide		81.80	0.27		88.70	0.27					84.80	0.27
R.K. Hall Materials Paris, TX												
Precinct 1				99.00						94.00		
Precinct 2				99.00						94.00		
Precinct 3				97.55						92.50		
Precinct 4 Ridgeway				97.55						92.50		
Precinct 4 Birthright				97.55						92.50		
County Wide					90.00						85.00	
Wood County Asphalt Mineola, TX												
Precinct 1												
Precinct 2												
Precinct 3												
Precinct 4 Ridgeway												
Precinct 4 Birthright												
County Wide	107.00	87.00		124.00	104.00					121.50	102.00	
Sustainable Pavement Dallas, TX												
Precinct 1										95.50	65.00	
Precinct 2										95.50	65.00	
Precinct 3										95.50	65.00	
Precinct 4 Ridgeway										95.50	65.00	
Precinct 4 Birthright										95.50	65.00	

**FYR 2023 ROAD OIL
COUNTY WIDE**

Vendor	Crude Delivered	Picked Up	Refined Delivered	Picked Up
Bryan & Bryan Henderson, Tx	No Bid	No Bid	730.00 per Ton	700.00 per Ton

Blazer Resources * 85.00 84.50
Leesburg, TX

Prices are subject to change

BASA Resources, Inc. * 95% of NYMEX * 95% of NYMEX * 95% of NYMEX
Dallas, TX

***But no less than \$50 per barrel**

Road Sealant 10/11/2022 Ergon Pit: Mt Pleasant	Road Service Sealant CRS2/gal			Road Service Sealant CRS2P/gal			AC-20-5TR/gal			CSS11 & CSS-1H Emulsion/gal		
	DEL	PU	Haul	DEL	PU	Haul	DEL	PU	Haul	DEL	PU	Haul
Precint 1												
Precint 2												
Precint 3												
Precint 4 Ridgeway												
Precinct 4 Birthright												
County Wide	3.18	3.00	0.18	3.58	3.40	0.18	4.35	3.95	0.40	3.23	3.05	0.18

This Bid is for Full Transport Loads of 5,500 Gallons. Freight is based on a full transport load, even if a full load of materials is not ordered. The Common carrier bills at \$90.00 per hour, after the second hour. Return freight is one-half of the outgoing tariff. Pump and hose charge is \$90.00 per load.

Federal Environmental fee will be added to above prices at rate of \$.49770/ton for asphalt and polymer loads or \$.00150/gal for emulsion loads.

P2 Emulsion
RICK McGinnis 817-307-6411

Product

	Tanker FOB Plant (per Gallon)	Tanker FOB County (per gallon)	Total/Drum FOB Plant (per Gal.)
1 P2 Stabilizer	2.68	2.96	2.90
2 P2 S1	2.68	2.96	2.90
3 P2 "Prime 11 Concentrate" Mixes with 6 parts water to make a prime, 4 parts water to make a tack Prime 11 Concentrate Per Ton Pricing	1.97	2.24	2.19
4 P2RTU	1.93	2.20	2.15
5 P2 Rejuvenator Asphalt Rejuvenator Rejuvenator Per Ton Pricing	2.68	2.96	2.90
6 CWE-2 (CHIP SEAL) CWE-2 Per Ton Pricing	3.01	3.29	3.23
7 CWP (Cold Weather Patch) Year Round Pot Hole Patch Emulsion CWP Per Ton Pricing	3.01	3.29	3.23
8 R.O.C. "Road Over Coat" for Chip Seal Roads	2.83	3.10	3.05

All listed prices are per U.S. Gallon

Minimum Tanker Delivery 5,000 Gallons

Delivery over 250 miles subject to additional charges

Demurrage (trucking charge): First 2 hours free, \$80.00 per hour there after.

Pump Charge (trucking charge): \$80.00 if needed.

Push Charge (trucking charge):\$80.00 per hour

Smaller Quantities Available, Subject to Freight Differential of \$0.25/gal less than 5,000 gal

Return Loads (trucking charge): Subject to charge from delivering freight lime

Extra charges, if applicable:

Containers available for smaller product amounts

"Tote" Containers (275 gallons size each) cost \$100.00 for container cost.

Drum Containers (55 gallons) cost \$35.00 for each container.

Containers are re-usable and can be rinsed out, brought back and re-filled at customer discretion
 Containers priced individually and sold only with orders for material